
City Of Torrington 

ENGINEERING DEPARTMENT 140 Main Street  City Hall 
(860) 489-2234 Torrington, CT 06790-5245 

Fax: (860) 489-2550 

Memorandum 
To: Honorable Mayor Elinor Carbone and City Council Members 

From: Paul Kundzins P.E. – Deputy Public Works Director / City Engineer 

Date: May 5, 2021 

Re: Accept the Town of Southbury bid process for Chip Sealing 

I respectfully request City Council accept the recommendation of the Deputy Public Works 

Director/City Engineer to authorize the Mayor to act on the behalf of the City to waive the City 

bid process and accept the Town of Southbury Town Wide Chip Seal Bid 2020-010 contract as 

awarded to Seymour Sealing Service Inc of Wallingford CT, for Chip Sealing, current expiration 

date June 6, 2022 and all subsequent renewable terms. 

Thank you for your consideration of this request. 

Paul Kundzins, P.E. 
Deputy Public Works Director/City Engineer 

Cc. Pennie Zucco- Purchasing 
      Ray Drew- Public Works Director 

5/5/2021 8:48 PM
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TORRINGTON TOWN CLERK



April 16, 2021 

Paul Kundzins, P.E. 

Deputy Public Works Director-City Engineer 

City of Torrington 

140 Main Street 

Torrington, CT 06790 

Dear Mr. Kundzins, 

The City of Torrington has the Town of Southbury's permission to piggyback your Bid Contract #2020-010 

March 25, 2020 with Seymour Sealing Services Inc of Wallingford, CT for the performance of ch ip sea ling 

for the duration of all contract renewa ls. 

7/7~ 
Tom Farrelly 

Town of Southbury 



Seymour Sec..~lir1g Service, ir1c. 
---- - ----~ . 

LIQUID Af.;Pf I Al T 'l • l' MUI ";Jr"Jl'\I~~ • Fl/\J\IU ANIJ ( HIP ~::!EAU., 

April 23, 2021 

Town of Southbury 
501 Main Street South 
Southbury, CT 06488 
Attn: Tom Farrelly 

RE: Town Wide Chip Seal Bid 

Dear Tom, 

Seymour Sealing Service Inc is pleased to extend the Town of Southbury's Town 
Wide Chip Seal bid 2020-010 from fiscal year 2020 to the July 1st, 2021-June JQth, 

2022 Fiscal year. This will include all pricing, terms, and warranties. 

We look forward to working with you. 

Sincerely, 

/!Jct:-ZI lLe: r..__~C 
Matt Neal 
President 
Seymour Sealing Service Inc. 

----~;7~/ 
Town offi~~CC<j.P!ance signature~~/' ""'/ 
Date: ~~( 

147 NORTH PU'..!NS IN[Jl )~')TRIAL RO/~O • WAU.iN[,F"'i...Jt-iLJ, CT 06482 
TEL (203) 29«-l 1 8 ~Cl 



SUBJECT TO APPROVAL 

SOUTHBURY BOARD OF SELECTMEN 
April 2, 2020 

RESOLVED, that the Southbury Board of Selectmen, 
upon the recommendation of the Director of Public 
Works, hereby awards the town wide chip seal bid to 
Seymour Sealing Services Inc. of Wallingford. 



DATE: 

TO: 

FROM: 

RE: 

March 30, 2020 

TOWN OF 
SOUTHBURY 

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

501 Main Street Sou th 

Southbury, Connecticut 06488 

(203) 262-0622 

Fax: (203) 262-1588 

Jeffery Manville, First Selectman 

John Cattell, Director of Public Works ~ 

Town Wide Chip Seal Bid Number 2020-010 

The Town received three (3) proposals for the Town Wide Chip Seal on March 251 2020. 

Present for the town at the bid opening were Betsy Rosa, Brian Calvert and myself. Proposals 

were based on unit prices for commonly used applications. Seymour Sealing Services Inc. is the 

low bidder. It is my recommendation that the Board of Selectman award the above bid to 

Seymour Sealing Services Inc. of Wallingford, CT for the unit prices listed on the attached bid 

summary. 

S:\ Bids __ Quotes_Proposals, Purchases\ CHIP SEALING\ Recommcnda ti on letter-Chip Seal.docx 



TOWN WIDE CHIP SEAL 

Bid Number 2020-010 
March 25 2020 

Bid Item Description 

1 PASS-CR & 1/411 Clean Stone 

2 PASS-CR & 3/8 11 Clean Stone 

3 PASS-CR & 1/4 11 Recycled Stone 

4 PASS-CR & 3/8" Recycled Stone 

5 CRS 2-P & 1/411 Clean Stone 

6 CRS 2-P & 3/8 11 Clean Stone 

7 CRS 2-P & 1/4 11 Recycled Stone 

8 CRS 2-P & 3/8 11 Recycled Stone 

9 Fog Sealing 

10 Road Sweeping 

Wittnessed By 

John Cottell 

Brian Calvert 

Betsy Rosa 

Seymour Sealing Gorman New England Asphalt 

2.13 $/SY No Bid No Bid 

2.43 $/SY No Bid No Bid 

1.97 $/SY No Bid No Bid 

2.13 $/SY No Bid No Bid 

1.45 $/SY 1.48 $/SY 1.56 $/SY 

1.54 $/SY 1-65 $/SY 1.63 $/SY 

1.25 $/SY No Bid No Bid 

1.27 $/SY No Bid No Bid 

0.48 $/SY 0.50 $/SY 0.48 $/SY 

125.00 $/HR 160.00 $/HR 170.00 $/HR 


