CITY OF TORRINGTON

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT Pennie Zucco, Purchasing Agent
140 Main Street, Room 206 Phone: (860)-489-2225
Torrington, CT 06790 Fax (860)-489-2547

Email: pennie_zucco@torringtonct.org

March 1, 2023

Mayor Elinor Carbone

Members of the City Council

RE: RFP # FCP-032-020923 FERTILIZING ATHLETIC FIELDS IN CITY PARKS

The City of Torrington received five (5) proposals for the Fertilizing of the Athletic Fields in the City Parks.

Distinguished Lawns, LLC
Bristol, CT

Diamond Landscapes & Athletic
Bridgeport, CT

TruGreen Corporation
Rocky Hill, CT

Savatree
New Miiford, CT

Premier Landscaping, LLC
Thomaston, CT

It is the recommendation of Tim Cote, Assistant Superintendent of Streets & Parks and Pennie Zucco,
Purchasing Agent to have City Council authorize the Mayor to award this project to supply and fertilize
the Athletic Fields located in the City Parks to TruGreen Corporation, Rocky Hill, CT and to have the
Mayor act on the behalf of the City regarding the execution of the contract and its administration. The
estimated cost for this project is $49,635.43.

Thank you for your consideration on this matter.

Rosie &/{m
Pennie Zucc

Purchasing Agent

cc: R. Drew; T. Cote
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Pennie Zucco

= = = —
From: Timothy Cote
Sent: Tuesday, February 21, 2023 1:31 PM
To: Pennie Zucco
Cc: Ray Drew
Subject: award of rfp#032-020923
Attachments: rfp fcp-032-020923 fertilizing athletic fields summary.pdf

Good afternoon Pennie,

After reviewing and summarizing the costs for each application in the RFP #032-020923, | would like to award the bid to
Tru Green Commercial as the lowest bidder.

I have attached the summary of costs for each application based on total square footage and the unit costs submitted by
each bidder.

Thank you for your help,

Timothy Cote

Assistant Superintendent of Streets and Parks
107 Arthur Street

Torrington, CT 06790

860.489.2332
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Bidder: TruGreen Corporation

Address: 89 Old Forge Road Rocky Hill, CT 06067
(Signed By) %{)—6 8@64@/%4%\./

Title: Business Development Representative

Name (please print) Joe Beckerman Date; 2/8/23

Phone: (860) 721-7872 Fax: (901) 251-3588 E-Mail:

Federal Tax Identification Number: (FEIN): 36-3734669



APPENDIX A

FERTILIZING ATHLETIC FIELDS IN CITY PARKS

RFP # FCP-032-020923

THE UNDERSIGNED AFFIRMS AND DECLARES that this Bid is executed with full knowledge and acceptance
of the specifications, requirements, terms and conditions contained herein and with complete understanding and
full compliance of system requirements and hereby submits this Bid for the request contained herein and
certifies that this Bid meets all the specifications and conditions requested herein. Any substitutions to the
specifications requested are clearly and completely noted.

Having received the specifications prepared by the City the undersigned hereby submits the following Unit
Prices to supply and install fertilizer on City athletic fields as outlined in the specifications, and attests that this
bid meets all the specifications and conditions stated in this Invitation to Bid.:

PROPOSED UNIT PRICES FOR FERTILIZING ATHLETIC FIELDS IN CITY PARKS, TORRINGTON, CT

06790:
Services Bid Price Per Square Foot
Slice Seeding 0379
Pre-emergent 0016
Fertilizer .0029
Grub Control 0016
Spray/Herbicide 0014
Core Aeration 016
Fertilizer/Replenish Round 2 |.0054
Spring application
Soil Testing Per Test

Part of TruGreen’s Service

No cost




ADDENDA

The following Addenda have been received. The modifications to the Bid Documents noted therein
have been considered and all costs thereto are included in the Base Bid.

Addenda # 1

Bidder: TruGreen Corporation

Address: 89 Old Forge Road

(Signed By) %U[U-()_/ I am_~ Title: Business Development Representative

Name (please print) Joe Beckerman Date: 2/8/23

Phone: 860-883-9050 Fax: 901-251-6734 E-Mail: josephbeckerman@irugreenrmail.com

Federal Tax Identification Number: (FEIN) 36-3734669

Comments:




APPENDIX B
FERTILIZING ATHLETIC FIELDS IN CITY PARKS
RFP # FCP-032-020923

List references for similar equipment provided for at least three (3) clients in the past five (5) years.
Please note is it the City’s intent to communicate with the references listed herein.
Bidder: TruGreen Corporation
Address: 89 Old Forge Road

Rocky Hill, CT 06067
******************************************************************************
Organization Name: Town of Bloomfield Phone: 860-243-1487
Contact Name: Merritt Ritson Email: mritson@Bloomfieldct.ore
Product Provided: Varies depending on time of season and customer’s specific needs
Project(s): Fertilization. weed control, grub control
******************************************************************************
Organization Name: Town of Columbia Phone: 860-966-8189
Contact Name: Beth Lunt Email: elunt@columbiact.org
Product Provided: Varies depending on time of season and customer’s specific needs
Project(s): Fertilization. weed control. grub control
******************************************************************************
Organization Name: Avon Public Schools Phone: 860-404-4789
Contact Name: Myles Altimus Email: maltimus@avon.k12.ct.us
Product Provided: Varies depending on time of season and customer’s specific needs
Project(s): Fertilization. weed control, grub control
******************************************************************************
Organization Name: East Hartford Public Schoos Phone: 860-622-5954
Contact Name: Dan Ford Email: ford.de@easthartford.org
Product Provided Varies depending on time of season and customer’s specific needs
Project(s): Fertilization. weed control. grub control
******************************************************************************
Organization Name: Manchester Water + Sewer Dept. Phone: 860-647-3216
Contact Name: Kyle Hopkins Email: khopkins@manchesterct.gov
Product Provided: Varies depending on time of season and customer’s specific needs
Project(s): Fertilization. weed control. grub control. lime




CITY OF TORRINGTON
ADDENDUM 1

ADDENDUM 1 ISSUED PERTAINING TO QUESTIONS/ANSWERS SUBMITTED FOR
FERTILIZING ATHLETIC FIELDS IN CITY PARKS

RFP # FCP-032-020923 FERTILIZING ATHLETIC FIELDS IN CITY PARKS
Date of opening: February 9, 2023 Time: 11:00 AM Location: City Hall, Room 206, 140 Main Street, Torrington
SUBMIT SIGNED ADDENDUM WITH BID

The City of Torrington reserves the right to award or reject any or all bids or any portion thereof, to waive technicalities: to award
the contract to a bidder other than the lowest bid and to award the bid and/or contracts to one or more bidders submitting
essentially identical proposals and, that in the city’s judgment, will best serve the public interest,

Dated in Torrington: January30, 2023 Purchasing Agent

Pennie Zucco

Contact name :lrb(_’/ 8@6&8/6/7/14?\ Phone: 8(&0 - 355’ 7 050

Authorized Representative JFDQ AJC‘C el man

Authorized Signature S}M /./;71'36’/%'/?7}15&71./

Company name v _,T,nu é)/‘"(f@ Val

Address 89 9ld Fepge Road

Ciy, State, Zip__ Rocley M/, CT 0,067

Fax_ 0] =25]- &' 734 Email __ {0580/ beclkarmzzn@fl/uwwm-n:r//,wm
Federal Tax Identification Number: (FEIN)__ 5L ~5' /57047 . ‘

QUESTIONS 1/30/2023 -2 /3/2 3ud dde dum Recewed + reviewed 'ﬂaﬁ' 6// o
2/8/23
Q1) Are the products going to be part of this bid, or are they on a separate bid, or are they going to be purchased by
the licensed applicator?

Al) It is the intent that the bidder will supply all labor and materials to complete seeding and fertilizing.

Q2) I would like to receive a copy of the bid responses from your last bid, particularly the winning response.
A2) see attached

Q3) Another question for the bid - the use of Replenish is required. | assume that is referring to an organic fertilizer.
Is the City of Torrington open to an equivalent substitute product?
A3) YES

Q4) s this a all or nothing bid? Will there be one bid awarded for all the services or will you just take the lowest for
each individual service?

A4) The City intends to use the same bidder for all work on athletic fields.

QS5) Will all the parks be awarded to the same bidder or will they be broken up to different bidders?
AS) The City intends to use the same bidder for all work on athletic fields.

Q6) What was the method of measurement used to get the parks SQFT on the bid?
A6) An approximate schedule of field sizes is included in the bid specification.



Q7) As 1review the program outlined in the bid I want to clarify the City of Torrington’s requirements:

°

Four (4) rounds of fertilization: early spring, spring, summer and fall - Yes.

Pre-emergent weed control applied in the early spring along with fertilizer and Replenish organic fertilizer -
Pre-emergent will be applied in the early spring. Fertilizer and Replenish will be applied in the
spring.

Pre-emergent weed control applied in the early spring along with fertilizer and Replenish organic fertilizer -
Pre-emergent will be applied in the early spring. Fertilizer and Replenish will be applied in the
spring.

One (1) application of broadleaf weed control in the spring - The bed form is for one application,
However, if the City sees the need for a second application, we will request another application per
the bid rates.

Grub control in the spring - It could be spring or summer the bid form included one application.

Slice seeding in the spring (after pre-emergent has been applied) - The bid form includes one Slice seeding
treatment. It is generally done in the spring or the fall, The actual application will be at the discretion
of the City.

Core aeration in the fall - The bid form includes one Core aeration treatment. It is generally done in the
spring or the fall. The actual application will be at the discretion of the City.



Items

Pre-Emergent/Fertilizer —

Fertllizer, Seed, and Infleld Agents, & Fertilizer Applications - April 4, 2022

Winfield United

Atlantic Golf & Turf

Premier Landscaping

Valley Green

Crabgrass/Broadleat NO BID $1,077.50 $40.00/50 Ib bag/10K-12K Sq ft $31.00/ 50 Ib bag
Dimension Dimansion-Nutrite 15-0-3
Dimension 2EW/2x2.5 Gal. 18-0-3.15% A0%XCU w/17%
Pre-Emergent/Fertilizer —
Crabgrass/Broadleaf No Bid $192.50/Qt NO BID $64.00/40 Ib bag
. Lebanon 21-22-4
Tupersan (Reg Expired) ‘ Slipstream 4L w/mesotrione
Weed Preventer/Fertilizer NO BID NO BID NO BID $36.00/40 Ib bag
Organic Product [ ‘ ‘ ‘ Nutrite 9-0-0 Corn gluten
Grub ControlFertiizer NOBID $41.75/50 Ibs./11,000n sq. ¢ $43.00/50 Bag/10K-12K sq.ft. $27.50/50 Ib bag
. 17-0-3/40% PCS/ 3%Fe
Merit ‘ 20-0-5 30% Mesa 21-0-4 Imidacloprid/Lamda-cy
Organic Fertilizer NOBID $30.00/50 Ibs./2500-5000 sq. ft NOBID NOBID
Pro Grow | | 5-3-4 l [
Other Fertilizer No Bid $55.00/50 Ibs./6,000 sq.ft. NO BID No Bid
Seablend - 12-0-12 | | 14-0.6 | |
Fertlizer NO BID $30,00/50 Ibs Bag $39.00/50 Ibs./10K-12K sg.ft. $26.50/50 Ib bag
Nutrite 24-0-
240-11 GreenWave 22-0-12 24-0.5 11/50%KCU/2% Fe
Knotweed Control 184,00/QT 4XQT-CASE NO BID NO BID $184.00/Qt.
Defender | Defender l
Granular Fertllizer NO BID $26.00/50 Ibs Bag NO BID $28.00/50 Ib bag
Lebanon Country Club 13-25-12 SGN Nutrite 16-25-
195 14-18-10 12/40%XCU/3.5%Ca
Granular Fertilizer No Bid $45.50/50 Ibs./13157 sq ft NO BID $38.75/50 Ib bag
Lebanon Country Club 24-0-8, .15 22-0-6 /a0% MESA w/.15%
Dimension 24-0-8,15 Dimension Dimension
Granular Fettilizer NOBID $40.56/50 Ibs./14,500 sq.ft NO BID $34.00/50 Ib bag
:;ga”"" Country Club 29-0-10 SGN 29-0-10 SGN 195 *PALLET 25-0-5/51% MESA Lebanon
QUANTITIES ONLY (45 Bags)* ProScape
$83.00/501bs/7,267-14,534
Granular Fertiizer NOBID sq.fr. NOBID 577.50/50 b bag
ProScape 25-0-5 51% MESA
. Proscape 19-0-9 .67% Acelepryn 100% EXPO .167%
Proscape 18-0-6 .87% Acelepryn *PALLET QUANTITIES ONLY (45 Dimension +.067%
Bags)* Acelepryn
Fertilizer NO BID $39.00/50lbs Bag NO BID $26.50/ 45 It bag
. 5-4-3/7% Ca/1% e
Replenish 8-2-2-8G Greenwave 10-0-3 J wifTurkey Organic
Granular Fertilizer NO BID $33.00/ 50 Ibs Bag NO BID 536.50/50 Ib bag
|Lebanon Pro 0-0-7 .067% Acelepryn | 0-0-7 Acelpryn | 1
Spray Follar $118.75/GAL 2X2.5 GAL-CS $593.75/2x2.5 NO BID 5296.88/2.5 Gal.
Q4 Plus | Q4 Plus [ 2.5 | |
Spray Foliar $300.00/4 07 4X4 0Z/Cs NO BID NO BID 300,00/ 4 oz.
Pylex | Pylex | NO 8ID | [
Organic Fertilizer NO BID $39.00/50 Ibs Bag NO BID $30,00/50 Ib bag
Other Fertilzer ' | Greenwaveroos | | 804 Nutrite O'Natural
$162.50/50 Ibs ratio $3.25/
Perennlal Rye Grass Seed No Bid $225.00/50 Ibs NO BID Ib
| | New Century Rye | VG Gold Tri-Rye
) : $157.50/50 1b ratio 53,95/
50/50 Sports Field Seed Mix No Bid $254.00/50 Ibs NO BID ib
| | 50/50 | | V& pre sparts Turf mix
$187.50/50 Ib ratia $3.75/
Kick Starl Recovery Mix — Grass Seed No Bid $236.00/50 Ibs NO BID b
| | Overseed Mix | VG Athletlc Mix
' $265.00/50 Ib ratio §5.30/
Toushdown 80/20 Mix — No Bid $292.00/50 Ibs. NO BID b
0, 0,
80% Bluegrass 20% | | Bauldragon Mix ‘ I VG 80% KBG/ 20% Rye Mix
Weed Control NOBID NO BID NO BID §95.00/ 5 Ib




Items Winfield United Atlantic Golf & Turf Premier Landscaping Valley Green
Prosecutor Glyphosel Pro Dry 7556
y $17.00/50 Ib bag - 40
Infield Drying Agent NOBID $19.90/50 bag NO BID bags/Pallet
Turface Quick Dry - 50 |b Bag | Pro's Choice Rapid Dry
$16.75/50 b bag - 40
Infield Conditioner NOBID $20.56/50 bag NO BID bags/Pallet
Pro's Choice Red
Turface MVP - 50 Ib Bag | Conditiorier
520.50/401b bag - 50
Mound Clay NOBID $24.00/50 bag NO 8iD bags/Pallet
Pro's Choice Easy Mound
Turface Mound Clay - 50 Ib Bag I Clay
$24.50/8 Brick Bag - 38
Clay Bricks NOBID $27.00/8 bricks per bag NO BID Bags/Pallet
Pro's Choice Easy Mound
8 Clay Bricks Per Bag i Bricks
Infield Clay NOBID No Bid NO BID No BID




Fertilizer, Seed, and Infield Agents, & Fertilizer Applications - April 4, 2022

Winfield Atlantic Golf  Premier
Items United and Turf Landscaping  Valley Green
Granular Applications
Alvord Park — Field 1 - 59,580 NO BID NO BID $90.00|NO BID
Alvord Park — Field 2 - 47,519 NO BID NQ BID $85.00/NO BID
Alvord Park — Buffer Area - 33,811 NO BID NO BID $60.00|NO BID
Bishop Donnelly — with Buffer Area -
103, 036 NO BID NO BID $130.00|NO BID
Fuessenich Park — with Buffer Area -
112,662 NO BID NO BID $150.00|NO BID
John Toro - Softball Field #1— w/ Buffer
Area - 71,363 NO BID NO BID $100.00|NO BID
John Toro - Softball Field #2— w/ Buffer
Area - 62,649 NO BID NO BID $85.00|NO BID
John Toro — Soccer Field - 29,269 NO BiD NO BID $65.00/NO BID
Major Besse Field — with Buffer Area -
386, 602 NO BID NO BID $65.00|NO BID
Joe Ruwet Field — with Buffer Area -
40,879 NO BID NO BID $70.00/NO BID
Oak Ave — Little League — with Buffer
Area - 34,862 NO BID NO BID $65.00NO BID
Oak Ave — Babe Ruth — with Buffer
Area - 74,834 NO BID NOQ BID $100.00/NO BID
Coe Memorial Park — lawn areas only -
140,817 NO BID NO BID $210.00/|NO BID
Spray Applications
Alvord Park — Field 1 - 59,580 NO BID NO BID $115.00/NO BID
Alvord Park — Field 2 - 47,519 NO BID NO BID $110.00{NO BID
Alvord Park — Buffer Area - 33,811 NO BID NO BID $85.00/NO BID
Bishop Donnelly — with Buffer Area -
103, 036 NO BID NO BID $155,00|NO BID
Fuessenich Park — with Buffer Area -
112,662 NO BID NO BID $175.00{NO BID
John Toro - Softball Field #1— w/ Buffer
Area - 71,363 NO BID NO BID $125.00{NO BID
John Toro - Softball Field #2— w/ Buffer
Area - 62,649 NO BID NO BID $110.00|NO BID
John Toro — Soccer Field - 29,269 NO BID NO BID $90.00{NO BID
Major Besse Field — with Buffer Area -
36, 602 NO BID NO BID $90.00|NO BID
Joe Ruwet Field — with Buffer Area -
40,879 NO BID NO BID $95.00{NO BID
Oak Ave - Little League — with Buffer
Area - 34,862 NO BID NO BID $90.00/NO BID
Oak Ave — Babe Ruth — with Buffer
Area - 74,834 NO BID NO BID $125.00{NO BID
Coe Memorial Park — lawn areas only -
140,817 NO BID NQ BID $310.00/NO BID
Weed Control — Spray Application -
Hourly Rate NO BID NO BID $50.00/NO BID




sax FCP-032 020923

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

STATE OF _ Lsypec ‘lcfc QT COUNTY OF /7’4 r‘:'f‘f(ﬂ;’?c}

..-—l"""“ . “ o 4 s .
L, J 055{79/‘ EC’CKC’/Z,/)?Q;; , being first duly sworn, deposes and says that:
1.1 am gucthettred vegiaealf  Tre Green the
bidder y e .
that has submitted the attached request for proposal for {Ffjj A 2/ 1:‘/? d 7% E%C )46[{5 :

2. | am fully informed respecting the preparation and conten the attached RFP and of all pertinent circumstances
respecting such bid;

3. Such Bid is genuine and is not a collusive or sham Bid;

4. Neither the Bidder nor any of its officers, partners, owners, agents, representatives, employees or parties of
interest, including this affiant, has in any way colluded, conspired, connived or agreed directly or indirectly with any
other Bidder, firm or person to submit a collusive or sham Bid in connection with the work for which the attached Bid
has been submitted nor has it in any manner, directly or indirectly, sought by agreement or collusion or
communication or conference with any other Bidder; firm or person to fix the price or prices in the attached Bid or of
any other Bidder, or to fix any overhead, profit or cost element of the Bid price or the price of any Bidder, or to secure
through any collusion, conspiracy, connivance or unlawful agreement any advantage against the City of Torrington or
any person interested in the proposed Bid; and

5. The price or prices quoted in the attached Bid are fair and proper and are not tainted by any collusion, conspiracy,
connivance or unlawful agreement on the part of the Bidder or any of it agents, representatives, owners, employees,
or parties in interest, including this affiant.

(Printed) Jo Sfi;ﬂ}i r)ﬁé’éié Ermneg»
(Signed) ?@qﬁgﬁ ﬁmlmw
| L - » ; -
(Title) Buss neys )’;35&’6’/ ",d mevit E{,ﬂ%’ﬁﬂ-féﬁyé

h -
Subscribed and sworn to before this % day of \"Eborc:\.) , 20 13

| b%m,g E)m,;ﬁ
Notary Rublic Printed

My commission expires __/2/31/ 2008~

Nofary Pfiblic Signature (notary seal)

DAQUAN BROWN
atiad, Notary Public, State of Connecticut
@ My Commission Expires Dec. 31, 2025
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